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Abstract: This paper uses Lorenz Curve and Gini Index with adjustment to per capita 
historical cumulative emission and constructs Carbon Gini Index to measure 
inequality in climate change area. The analysis using Carbon Gini Index shows that 
70% of carbon space in the atmosphere has been used for unequal distribution, which 
is almost the same as that of income in the country with the biggest gap between rich 
and poor in the world. The carbon equity should be an urgency and priority in the 
climate agenda. Carbon Gini Index established in this paper can be used to measure 
inequality in the distribution of carbon space and provide a quantified indicator for 
measurement of carbon equity among different proposals. 
Key words: climate change; carbon equity; long-term mitigation goal; cumulative 
emission per capita; Carbon Gini Index  

1.Introduction 

One of the key issues of addressing climate change is to enact a reasonable global 
long term emission reduction target and implement the equal allocation of carbon 
dioxide emission space. The quantitative global long term target will certainly limit 
the global carbon dioxide emission space. The unequal allocation of the limited 
carbon dioxide emission space would largely restrict the future emission space of 
developing counties. The earth’s atmosphere is human’s public nature resource, 
reasonable emission space is indispensable for human development. Therefore, we 
should allocate and use the emission space under the principle of global carbon 
equality. This is the cornerstone of global addressing climate change cooperation. 
 
Chinese scholars[1-5] employed the cumulative carbon dioxide emission per capita as 
index, revealed the different historical responsibility of developed countries and 
developing countries. Moreover, the scholars proposed the principle of cumulative 
emission per capita convergence as the guideline. Under the principle of cumulative 
emission per capita convergence, Chinese scholars proposed the carbon budget and 
carbon emission account methods[6-7] as the emission space allocation system design. 
Although the cumulative emission per capita reveals the different historical 
responsibility of different counties, it cannot provide a comprehensive index which 
covers every county’s cumulative emission per capita, nor can it provide a general 



measurement of emission space allocation equality. Therefore, many studies used 
income equality measurement method, measured emission equality with different 
income equality index. Hedenus and Azar[8]measure emission inequality across 
countries by the well-known Atkinson index. Duro and Padilla[9] apply the 
decomposable Theil index of inequality to emissions and show convincingly that 
global inequality in per capita emissions is largely due to inequalities in per capita 
income across countries. Heil and Wodon[10-11] use the Gini-index to measure the 
inequality of emission across countries. Groot[12] established the carbon Lorenz curves 
and carbon Gini coefficient based on the annual per capita emission. The literatures 
above measured the emission space equality with income equality measurement 
indexes, but these literatures are all based on the annual per capita emission. The 
contribution of this paper is to reestablish the carbon Lorenz curves and Gini indexes 
based on the historical cumulative emission per capita which has essential difference 
with the annual per capita emission measurement. Firstly, the existence time of GHG 
in atmosphere is more than a century, the cumulative emission can show a certain 
country’s climate change historical responsibility more clearly than annual emission. 
Consequently the historical cumulative emission per capita can represent the carbon 
equality more. Secondly, the emissions within a certain period determine the 
temperature rise. The definition of equality is to measure the overall emission 
allocation in the certain period, rather than annual emission allocation. 
 

2. Carbon Equality and Measurement     

The essence of carbon equality is to measure the difference of each emission 
allocation plans. Although allocation difference is a new topic in climate change 
studies, it has been thoroughly investigated in the income allocation equality 
researches[13-14]. The commonly used resident income allocation difference indexes 
are variation coefficient, Gini coefficient, Generalized Entropy index, Atkinson index. 
The Gini coefficient is most widely used index. Such indexes are usually used to 
statically mapping the wealth allocation and social stability of a certain country or 
district. 
 
The Lorenz curve had been initially proposed by Lorenz in 1907. It indicates the 
relations between population shares and income shares. Cumulative emission shares 
on the vertical and cumulative population shares on the horizontal axis. The curve 
reflects the relations between emission shares and population shares. If the population 
shares are not equal to the income shares, the inequality exist. If the allocation is 
perfect equal, then Lorenz curve is the straight line with the slope of 45 degree. That 
is the “perfect equal allocation curve”(Fig.1). Based on the Lorenz carve, Gini 
proposed the equality level measurement index which is Gini index. Defined the area 
between the actual allocation curve and perfect equal allocation curve as X, the area 
below the actual allocation curve as Y. Then the Gini index equals to X/(X+Y). The 
economical meaning of Gini index is that the inequality level of the income allocation 



equals to the income used for unequal allocation among total residential income. Gini 
index is a real number between 0 and 1. The perfect equal allocation’s Gini index is 0, 
while the perfect unequal allocation’s Gini index is 1. Gini index is a general index, 
reveal a general level of the allocation equality. According to the UN’s definition, 
Gini index < 0.2 corresponds perfect income equality, 0.2-0.3 corresponds relative 
equality, 0.3-0.4 corresponds adequate equality, 0.4-0.5 corresponds big income gap. 
Above 0.5 corresponds severe income gap. Therefore, the warning level of Gini index 
is 0.4. This paper used the division above to investigate the carbon inequality issue. 
How to use Gini index to provide a more meaningful division is still an issue which 
need further research, since this involves the welfare meanings of the carbon space 
allocation. 
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Fig.1. Lorenz Curve and Gini Index 

 
Lorenz curve and Gini index reflect the relations between income shares and 
population shares. Whenever the income shares and population shares are not equal to 
each other, inequality exists. The convergence of cumulative per capita proposed by 
Chinese scholars reflects this equal principle. This idea applied with the Lorenz curve 
and Gini index means that everyone has the same cumulative emission space, no 
carbon inequality. 
 
Developed countries had emitted large amount of GHG in their industrialization 
process. These GHG cumulated in the atmosphere, not only enhanced the green house 
effect, but also led to global warming and many other climate changes. Moreover, 
GHG of developed countries occupied the emission space and made developing 



countries face a more restricted emission limit. Therefore, Gini index can also 
measure equality situation of different emission allocation plans. When using the 
Lorenz curve and Gini index, horizontal axis is changed from households to 
population, while vertical axis is changed from income to emissions. This paper 
calculated the carbon equality with historical cumulative emission statistics. Based on 
such statistics we established the “carbon Lorenz curve” to reflect different counties 
unequal emission allocation level. According to “Carbon Lorenz Curve”, we can 
calculate the “Carbon Gini Index” to quantitatively measure the emission inequality 
of different countries. 
 

3. Carbon Lorenz Curve and Carbon Gini Index Calculation     

When investigating different countries’ historical cumulative emission situation, this 
paper focused on the carbon dioxide emission from energy activities. Baumert[15] 
suggested that CO2 is the main GHG，CO2 emission from energy activities contribute 
more than 2/3 of the world GHG total. This paper calculated the historical cumulative 
emissions by simply add the emissions, this is a widely used method.  
 
In order to understand how the historical cumulative emission per capita Lorenz curve 
is established, firstly we define country n as followings: 
 

n
iG  is the i th year CO2 of country n, n

iP  is the i th year population of country n, 
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is the 

country n’s historical cumulative CO2 emission share from i th year to j th year, n
ijC is 

the country n’s historical cumulative CO2 emission per capita from i th year to j th 
year.  
 

n
ijC is the important emission equality measurement index which is proposed by this 

paper. It also helps to sort the data when establishing the Lorenz curve. There are two 

ways to calculate n
ijC . One is to add up the annual emission per capita. Another is to 



add up the CO2 emission n
ijC , and divide n

ijC with population n
jP . Although two 

method have different output, they are essentially the same. Moreover, this paper will 
use population share. It is not suitable to calculate the cumulative population. 
Accordingly, we adopt the latter method: 

n
ijn

ij n
j

C
C

P
=                                                           (1) 

 
Table.1 provides from 1850 to 2006 the main countries historical cumulative CO2 

emission, population and the historical cumulative emission per capita according to 
the function (1) calculation. The all data are from Climate Analysis Indicators Tool 
(CAIT), Version 7.0, (see World Resources Institute). From Table.1 we can see that 
USA is the world biggest CO2 emission country from the industry revolution, the 
historical cumulative emission of USA is 30% of world total. Developed countries, 
such as USA and Britain, had the historical cumulative emission per capita which was 
more than times bigger than developing counties such as China and India. The 
historical cumulative emission per capita can reflect the inequality of carbon space 
allocation. Comparing to developed countries, developing countries’ industrialization 
is latter and on the low level. Developing countries are allocated with less resource in 
the constrained carbon space, but developing countries are having large population, 
these results to the developing countries’ residents can not enjoy an equal emission 
right. 
 

Table.1. historical cumulative emission of major countries from 1850 to 2006 
(Data source: CAIT V7.0) 

Country 

Historical 
cumulative 

CO2emission 
(M t) 

Historical 
cumulative 

CO2 
share(%) 

2006 
population 

(103) 

Population 
share(%) 

Historical 
cumulative 

CO2emission 
per capita 

(t per capita) 

Kyot
o 

Anne
x I 

(Y/N
) 

UK 68235.8 5.96% 60226 0.94% 1133 Y 
USA 333747.8 29.14% 296507 4.60% 1125.6 Y 

German
y 

80377 7.02% 82469 1.28% 974.6 Y 

Russian 
Fed 

93081.6 8.13% 143150 2.22% 650.2 Y 

Australia 12715.8 1.11% 20400 0.32% 623.3 Y 
France 32278.6 2.82% 60873 0.95% 530.3 Y 
Japan 44535.2 3.89% 127773 1.98% 348.5 Y 
South 
Africa 

12793 1.12% 46892 0.73% 272.8 N 

Mexico 11768 1.03% 103089 1.60% 114.2 N 



China 99204.2 8.66% 1304500 20.25% 76 N 
Brazil 9457.5 0.83% 186831 2.90% 50.6 N 
India 27433.6 2.40% 1094583 16.99% 25.1 N 

 
When we focusing on the every country’s CO2 emission from i th year to j th year, we 

have to sort the countries by historical cumulative emission per capita n
ijC and give 

the countries sequence number s. After sorting the countries in ascending order, set 
cumulative population of j th year on the horizontal axis, set cumulative historical 
cumulative emission per capita form i th year to j th year on the vertical axis. It should 
be noted that the “cumulative” in this part is referring to the adding up of countries 

which’s sequence number is less than s. Therefore, the coordinates ( ),s sp c  refer to 

,t t
s j s ij

t s t s
p p c c

≤ ≤

= =∑ ∑ . 

 
Connected the different countries’ points in the coordinate system with a smooth 
curve, we established the Lorenz curve based on the historical cumulative emission 
per capita form i th year to j th year. Fig.2 shows the carbon Lorenz curve stated from 
1850 and lists the positions of different countries. As the Lorenz curve is sorted by the 
historical cumulative emission per capita, the country’s position is more close to the 
upright, the higher historical cumulative emission per capita is and the bigger 
historical responsibility one country should take in climate change issue. Moreover, 
from Fig.2 we can learn that developing countries have the 82% population of world’s 
total, but merely occupy 25% cumulative emission of world’s total. As to developed 
countries, they have the 18% population of world’s total, but occupy 75% cumulative 
emission of world’s total.   
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Fig.2. Carbon Lorenz Curve using 1850 as starting year 

    
Based on the carbon Lorenz curve, this paper calculated the Gini index. Similar to the 
income Gini index calculation, this paper used two methods. One is the area method, 
the other is mean variance method. 
 
The area method is according to the definition of Gini index. As mentioned before, 

since ( ) 0.5X Y+ =  , therefore: 

0.5 1 2
0.5

X YG Y
X Y

−
= = = −

+
             (2)

  
 
The main difference between various area calculation methods is the area Y 
calculation. One way is to select a suitable fitting Lorenz curve, and then use 
integration to calculate the area. Another way divides Y into several trapezoids. The 
sum of the trapezoidal area is near to area Y. 
 



0% 10% 20% 30% 40% 50% 60% 70% 80% 90% 100%
0%

10%

20%

30%

40%

50%

60%

70%

80%

90%

100%

em
is

si
on

 p
er

 c
ap

ita

Cumulative population share

(ps,cs)

(ps-1,cs-1)

C
um

ul
at

iv
e 

sh
ar

e 
of

 h
is

to
ric

al
 c

um
la

tiv
e

As

 
Fig.3. Gini index calculation using trapezoid method 

 
We assumed that there are S countries and we can divide the total area into S 
trapezoids: 

1 1
1

1 1 1

( )( ) 1 ( )
2 2

S S S
ss s s s

s s s j
s s s

c c p pY A c c p− −
−

= = =

+ −
= = = +∑ ∑ ∑        (3)    

 
Apparently, when the S is big enough, the result above is almost the same as real 
value. 
 
Another commonly used method is mean difference method. We define the absolute 

mean variance as a b
ij ijE C CΔ = − , relative mean variance as / ijCΔ , a and b is the 

sequence number of different countries, ijC is the historical cumulative world 

emission per capita. Gini index is the half of the relative mean variance. Therefore: 

2 2

a b a b
a b j j ij ij

ij ij a b
m m

jij ij
m

p p C CE C C
G

C C p

−−
= =

∑∑
∑

         (4) 

The covariance equation can derive from the equation (4). As following: 
1 [2cov( , ) cov( , )]a a a

ij a ij jm m
jij

m

G C p C p
C p

= −
∑

         (5) 



The most important thing in carbon equality and carbon budget is how to set the 
starting year. Many researches confirmed that the earlier the starting year was, the 
more historical responsibility is reflected. But they did not provide a quantitative 
analysis of the various starting years’ impacts on the historical responsibility. This 
paper try to use the carbon Lorenz and carbon Gini index to quantitatively analyze the 
impact of the starting year on historical responsibility. Fig.4 shows the Lorenz curves 
of different starting years. Table 2 shows Gini index results of different starting years 
in various calculation methods. We can learn that different calculation methods do not 
affect the Gini index value much, but the different starting years have big influence on 
the Gini index value. The latter the starting year, the lower the Gini index is. That 
means as the starting years become bigger, the carbon space allocation inequality has 
been concealed. On the global level, carbon Gini index do not change much when 
comparing the 1850 starting year calculation and 1900 starting year calculation. But 
the 1950 starting year calculation and 1990 starting year calculation have largely 
underestimate the carbon inequality. 1950 calculation has 4% underestimation of the 
carbon space allocation inequality, while 1990 calculation has 14% underestimation 
of the carbon space allocation inequality. From 1850 to 2006, 70% of the cumulative 
emission space has been allocated unequally, but when starting from 1990 this figure 
decreases to 60%. No matter what the starting year is, the inequality of carbon space 
allocation need to be concerned. According to the World Banking statistics, among the 
182 countries there are 3 countries income Gini indexes are above 0.6. The biggest 
income gap is in Namibia which has the income Gini index of 0.74. The Gini index of 
carbon space allocation is 0.70 from 1850. Even focusing on the 1990 calculation, the 
carbon Gini index can still reach 0.60 which is on the same level with the biggest 
income gap country. 
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Fig.4. Carbon Lorenz Curve by using different starting years 



 

Table.2. Carbon Gini Index based on the historical cumulative emission per capita 
Calculation 

method 
1850—2006 1990—2006 1950—2006 1990—2006 

Fitting 
method 

0.70 0.70 0.67 0.60 

Trapezoid 
area method 

0.70 0.69 0.66 0.59 

Gini mean 
difference 

method 
0.70 0.69 0.66 0.59 

Covariance 
method 

0.70 0.69 0.66 0.59 

 

4 Conclusion         

  Economics and sociology focus more on the economical variances’ inequality, 
especially income inequality. Income is a key factor which determines the welfare. In 
the field of climate change, the unequal allocation of carbon emission pace is very 
crucial, but there are few measurement of inequality research on the theory and 
application. The quantification of the carbon allocation inequality has great 
significance. According to the quantification, we can investigate the climate change 
inequality issue in another view. For example, measure the inequality level and trends, 
and then look for the key factor that affects the inequality. The income allocation 
related literatures have provided many meaningful indexes and tools for inequality 
research. After adjustment, such indexes can be applied to the emission space 
allocation related carbon inequality issue. This paper, based on the historical 
cumulative emission per capita, established the carbon Lorenz curve and carbon Gini 
index to quantitatively analyzed the emission space allocation inequality issue. 
 
The historical cumulative emission per capita based carbon Gini index has several 
values as following: 1) historical cumulative emission per capita based carbon Gini 
index reflect the severe inequality of current emission allocation in a more general 
way, it help the policy maker and publics to know the emission allocation inequality 
level. 2) Carbon Gini index can not only analyze the current situation of the emission 
space allocation inequality, but also compare the emission space allocation inequality 
of different future allocation plans, this can reveal the equality mean of different 
future emission allocation plans. 3) By using the carbon Gini index and carbon Lorenz 
curve, we can further know the deep-seated factors in carbon inequality by factor 
decomposition.  
 
The result of the carbon Gini index based on the historical cumulative emission per 



capita shows that current emission space allocation is severe unequal. The inequality 
situation is on the same level with the biggest income gap country. In the 1850-2006 
calculation period, carbon Gini index reaches 0.70 which is far beyond the warning 
level of income inequality. This result indicates that 70% of the world total emission 
space is allocated unequally and such space has been excessively occupied by 
developed countries. The carbon Gini index has confirmed that developed countries 
had excessively occupied the emission space. According to the principle of UNFCCC, 
developed countries should take the lead to reduce their emissions to redress the 
unequal situation. 
 
The selection of starting year has great influence on the carbon Gini index. The 
inequality of carbon space allocation has been concealed as the starting year becomes 
bigger. Even focusing on the 1990 calculation, the carbon Gini index can still reach 
0.60 which is far beyond the warning line. Carbon index can be used as a static index 
to measure the inequality of emission allocation. It also provides a quantitative index 
for international carbon equality discussion. At present, many institutes and scholars 
proposed various future carbon dioxide emission space allocation plans. It is difficult 
to compare the different plans. The carbon Gini index in this paper can reveal the 
equality meaning of different allocation plans, compare the different plans in the 
equality measurement. 
 



Reference 

[1]  He, J., Z. Wu., W. Chen.2000: Equal Right Principle and Impact of Greenhouse 
Gas Control on China’s Economy. Research Report 96-911-03-01, Tsinghua 
University 

[2]  He, J., B. Liu., Y. Chen, et al., 2007: National Assessment Report on Climate 
Change (III): Integrated evaluation of strategies on response to climate change 
in China. Science Press, 273-274 

[3]  He, J., W. Chen., F. Teng, et al., 2009: Long-Term Climate Change Mitigation 
Target and Carbon Permit Allocation. Advances in Climate Change Research, 
5(6), 362-368. 

[4]  Ding, Z., X. Duan., Q. Ge, et al., 2009: Control of atmospheric CO2 
concentration by 2050: An allocation on the emission rights of different countries. 
Sci China Ser D-Earth Sci, 39(8), 1009-1027. 

[5]  Chen, W., Z. Wu., and J, He, 2005: Two-convergence approach for future global 
carbon permit allocation. Journal of Tsinghua University( Science and 
Technology), 45(6), 848-853. 

[6]  Pan, J, 2008: Carbon Budget for Basic Needs Satisfaction: implications for 
international equity and sustainability. World Economics and Politics, 1, 35-42. 

[7]  Project Team of Development Research Center of the State Council of China, 
2009: Greenhouse Gas Emissions Reduction: A Theoretical Framework and 
Global Solution. Economic Research Journal, 3(3), 1-13. 

[8] Hedenus, F., Azar, C., 2005: Estimates of trends in global income and resource 
inequalities. Ecological Economics, 55, 351-364. 

[9]  Duro, J.A., Padilla, E., 2006: International inequalities in per capita CO2 
emissions: a decomposition methodology by Kaya factors. Energy Economics, 
28, 170-187. 

[10]  Heil, M.T., Wodon, Q.T., 1997: Inequality in CO2 emissions between poor and 
rich countries. Journal of Environment and Development, 6, 426-452. 

[11]  Heil, M.T., Wodon, Q.T., 2000: Future inequality in CO2 emissions and the 
impact of abatement proposals. Environmental and Resource Economics, 17, 
163-181. 

[12]  Groot, L., 2010: Carbon Lorenz Curve. Resource and Energy Economics, 32, 
45-64. 

[13]  Wan, G., 2009: Inequality Measurement and Decomposition: A Survey. China 
Economic Quarterly, 8(1): 347-367. 

[14]  Xu, K., 2008: How Has the Literature on Gini's Index Evolved in the Past 80 
Years, China Economic Quaterly, 2(4), 757-777. 

[15] Baumert, K.A., Herzog, T., Pershing, J., 2005: Navigating the Numbers: 
Greenhouse Gas Data and International Climate Policy. World Resources         
Institute. 



NOTE DI LAVORO DELLA FONDAZIONE ENI ENRICO MATTEI 

Fondazione Eni Enrico Mattei Working Paper Series 

Our Note di Lavoro are available on the Internet at the following addresses: 
http://www.feem.it/getpage.aspx?id=73&sez=Publications&padre=20&tab=1 

http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/JELJOUR_Results.cfm?form_name=journalbrowse&journal_id=266659 
http://ideas.repec.org/s/fem/femwpa.html 

http://www.econis.eu/LNG=EN/FAM?PPN=505954494 
http://ageconsearch.umn.edu/handle/35978 

http://www.bepress.com/feem/ 
 
 
 
 

NOTE DI LAVORO PUBLISHED IN 2011 
SD 1.2011 Anna Alberini, Will Gans and Daniel Velez-Lopez: Residential Consumption of Gas and Electricity in the U.S.: 

The Role of Prices and Income 
SD 2.2011 Alexander Golub, Daiju Narita and Matthias G.W. Schmidt: Uncertainty in Integrated Assessment Models of 

Climate Change: Alternative Analytical Approaches 
SD 3.2010 Reyer Gerlagh and Nicole A. Mathys: Energy Abundance, Trade and Industry Location 
SD 4.2010 Melania Michetti and Renato Nunes Rosa: Afforestation and Timber Management Compliance Strategies in 

Climate Policy. A Computable General Equilibrium Analysis 
SD 5,2011 Hassan Benchekroun and Amrita Ray Chaudhuri: “The Voracity Effect” and Climate Change: The Impact of 

Clean Technologies 
IM 6.2011 Sergio Mariotti, Marco Mutinelli, Marcella Nicolini and Lucia Piscitello: Productivity Spillovers from Foreign 

MNEs on Domestic Manufacturing Firms: Is Co-location Always a Plus? 
GC 7.2011 Marco Percoco: The Fight Against Geography: Malaria and Economic Development in Italian Regions 
GC 8.2011 Bin Dong and Benno Torgler: Democracy, Property Rights, Income Equality, and Corruption 
GC 9.2011 Bin Dong and Benno Torgler: Corruption and Social Interaction: Evidence from China 
SD 10.2011 Elisa Lanzi, Elena Verdolini and Ivan Haščič: Efficiency Improving Fossil Fuel Technologies for Electricity 

Generation: Data Selection and Trends 
SD 11.2011 Stergios Athanassoglou: Efficient Random Assignment under a Combination of Ordinal and Cardinal 

Information on Preferences 
SD 12.2011 Robin Cross, Andrew J. Plantinga and Robert N. Stavins: The Value of Terroir: Hedonic Estimation of 

Vineyard Sale Prices 
SD 13.2011 Charles F. Mason and Andrew J. Plantinga: Contracting for Impure Public Goods: Carbon Offsets and 

Additionality 
SD 14.2011 Alain Ayong Le Kama, Aude Pommeret and Fabien Prieur: Optimal Emission Policy under the Risk of 

Irreversible Pollution 
SD 15.2011 Philippe Quirion, Julie Rozenberg, Olivier Sassi and Adrien Vogt-Schilb: How CO2 Capture and Storage Can 

Mitigate Carbon Leakage 
SD 16.2011 Carlo Carraro and Emanuele Massetti: Energy and Climate Change in China 
SD 17.2011 ZhongXiang Zhang: Effective Environmental Protection in the Context of Government Decentralization 
SD 18.2011 Stergios Athanassoglou and Anastasios Xepapadeas: Pollution Control: When, and How, to be Precautious 
SD 19.2011 Jūratė Jaraitė and Corrado Di Maria: Efficiency, Productivity and Environmental Policy: A Case Study of 

Power Generation in the EU 
SD 20.2011 Giulio Cainelli, Massimiliano Mozzanti and Sandro Montresor: Environmental Innovations, Local Networks 

and Internationalization 
SD 21.2011 Gérard Mondello: Hazardous Activities and Civil Strict Liability: The Regulator’s Dilemma 
SD 22.2011 Haiyan Xu and ZhongXiang Zhang: A Trend Deduction Model of Fluctuating Oil Prices 
SD 23.2011 Athanasios Lapatinas, Anastasia Litina and Eftichios S. Sartzetakis: Corruption and Environmental Policy: 

An Alternative Perspective 
SD 24.2011 Emanuele Massetti: A Tale of Two Countries:Emissions Scenarios for China and India 
SD 25.2011 Xavier Pautrel: Abatement Technology and the Environment-Growth Nexus with Education 
SD 26.2011 Dionysis Latinopoulos and Eftichios Sartzetakis: Optimal Exploitation of Groundwater and the Potential for 

a Tradable Permit System in Irrigated Agriculture 
SD 27.2011 Benno Torgler and Marco Piatti. A Century of American Economic Review 
SD 28.2011 Stergios Athanassoglou, Glenn Sheriff, Tobias Siegfried and Woonghee Tim Huh: Optimal Mechanisms for 

Heterogeneous Multi-cell Aquifers 
SD 29.2011 Libo Wu, Jing Li and ZhongXiang Zhang: Inflationary Effect of Oil-Price Shocks in an Imperfect Market: A 

Partial Transmission Input-output Analysis  
SD 30.2011 Junko Mochizuki and ZhongXiang Zhang: Environmental Security and its Implications for China’s Foreign 

Relations 
SD 31.2011 Teng Fei, He Jiankun, Pan Xunzhang and Zhang Chi: How to Measure Carbon Equity: Carbon Gini Index 

Based on Historical Cumulative Emission Per Capita 
 
 
 

 




