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Abstract

Research studies have proven that place-based/regional branding methods have a positive effect on brand equity and economic benefits for
companies. However, very small or specific regions may be confusing to consumers, so conjunctive labeling – or the process of advertising both a
larger region and the sub-region of origin for a product – is suggested as a remedy for this situation. This study analyzes the impact of conjunctive
labeling by comparing two national samples of consumers, before and two years after, conjunctive wine labeling was introduced in Sonoma
County. The results show a higher awareness for both Sonoma County and its sub appellations (AVAs) after conjunctive labeling was introduced
than before. This demonstrates the potential benefit of associating sub-regional appellations with larger wine regions.
& 2017 UniCeSV, University of Florence. Production and hosting by Elsevier B.V. This is an open access article under the CC BY-NC-ND
license (http://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc-nd/4.0/).

Keywords: Regional branding; Appellations; Wine marketing; Conjunctive labeling; Place-based marketing
1. Introduction

1.1. The growth of place based branding and regional
marketing

Increased use of place-based branding for small food and
beverage producers, within a defined geographic area, warrants
investigation of the success of this promotional strategy. Wine
producers see place-based branding as a way to promote the
unique appeal of their particular location to buyers. Studies
have shown that place based marketing does have a positive
effect on enhancing brand equity and creating economic
benefits for firms (Tustin and Lockshin, 2001, Papadopoulos
and Heslop, 2002; Hall, 2003; Lee and Arcodia, 2011;
Christensen et al., 2015).

There is growing evidence that consumers, as well as
producers, have preferences for products based on geographical
10.1016/j.wep.2017.10.003
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representation (Rendleman et al., 2016). The value consumers
find in messages touting a product's place of origin has
increased because many people are more conscious about their
diet, and in response, they have adopted “buy local” beliefs
(Ruth-McSwain, 2012). According to Rose et al. (2008),
consumers who prefer to purchase locally grown products
respond well to promotional appeals emphasizing place based
branding.
Evidence illustrates the fact that regional identities are being

created for a wide range of products around the world. In the
wine sector there is a long tradition of relying on place as a
means to convey a product's unique characteristics, and to
serve as a cue for quality. Wines from diverse regions such as
Bordeaux, Napa, and Barolo, just to name a few examples,
possess reputations based on their strong association with the
place in which they are produced. For this reason, wine
provides an appropriate context for the study of regional
branding. Johnson and Bruwer (2007) even demonstrated the
value in both creating awareness and influencing perceptions
through the promotion of a regional identity in wine.
Caldwell and Freire (2004) found distinctive differences

between branding a country, versus a region or city, suggesting
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that smaller sub regions should focus more on functional
aspects of the product. However, in the food industry, adding a
regional designation to a product in addition to state designa-
tion offers the potential for the producer to charge a price
premium (Hu et al., 2012). The increasing divergence in wine
region identities into zones, regions and sub-regions, suggests
that a repeated, consistent message of the value of a geogra-
phical identity has a greater opportunity of creating and
retaining salience in the minds of consumers. Consequently,
this study investigates the value of attaching the reputation of a
smaller American Viticultural Area (AVA) to the reputation of
the larger region through “conjunctive labeling” (having the
larger region on all wine label imprints). The region of
Sonoma County is the focus of this research because producers
began to implement the use of conjunctive labeling for wine in
2014 (Sonoma County Vintners 2016).

1.2. The emergence of wine appellations

An appellation is a geographical designation that is usually
defined by law, and is used for food and beverages. Wine
appellations are some of the oldest in the world, with
references from Pliny the Elder in 154 BC describing
Falernian from the slopes of Mt. Falernus south of Rome,
as well as mention of wine regions in the Bible, such as wine
from Sameria. The oldest legally protected vineyard zone
was established in Chianti, Italy in the early 1700s, followed
by the Tokay region in Hungary in the 1730s and the Douro
region of Portugal in the 1750s. However, it was not until
1935 in France that a rigorous appellation system was
implemented under the Institute National des Appellations
of Origin (INAO), through the creation of AOC certification.
As a result, today most major wine regions have some type of
legal system to define wine appellations, emulating the
European application of the original French standard
(European Commission, 2016).

1.3. American viticultural areas

In the US, local and regional wine appellations are called
American Viticultural Areas, or more commonly, AVAs. An
AVA is defined as “a designated US grape growing area,
which is distinguished by unique geographical features (US
Dept of Treasury, 2011, p. 1).” These features usually include
distinctive climate and geographic features, and often a history
of winemaking in the region. AVAs do not guarantee quality
of wine or require specific viticulture processes, but instead
communicate an authentic and distinctive winegrowing region.
Furthermore, there is no standard size for an AVA in terms of
acreage. They can be quite small in size or span multiple states.

The first AVA authorized by the Bureau of Alcohol,
Tobacco and Firearms (BATF, now the TTB) was for the
region of Augusta, in the state of Missouri, on June 20, 1980.
Napa Valley became the second US AVA and California's first
AVA in 1981. Napa Valley wine leaders also made a
conscious decision to name its other more specific regions in
the valley as “nested AVAs,” and require conjunctive labelling
so that all wineries must include the name “Napa Valley” on
the label. Therefore, a winery located in the Rutherford sub
AVA, could include both Rutherford and Napa Valley on the
label, but Napa Valley must always be present. In a research
study investigating this decision and Napa Valley's role as a
world-recognized wine region, Taplin (2011) identified the
cooperative activities of the community of vintners as crucial
to their growth and success.

1.4. Conjunctive labeling in the US and abroad

The concept of conjunctive labeling for wine is rather
rare in the United States. Napa Valley was the first region to
require conjunctive labeling in 1990 as part of California
Business & Professions code #25240. All Napa Valley
wineries are mandated to include the term “Napa Valley” on
the front label in a regulated font size, regardless of
whether or not they also include one of the Napa Valley
sub-AVAs, such as Rutherford. Not complying with the
rule could result in the California Alcohol Beverage
Control revoking the winery license (Wine Compliance
Alliance, 2015). Furthermore the wine label will not be
approved by the TTB, the federal agency that regulates
wine labels in the US. Sonoma County was the second
region to implement a conjunctive label rule (Rives, 2011),
going into effect on January 1, 2014. Most recently the
Monterey Wine region announced they will begin conjunc-
tive labeling, and California Governor Jerry Brown signed
a bill confirming this will go into effect on January 1, 2019
(Monterey Wines, 2015).
As of November 30, 2016, there were 239 AVAs in the

contiguous United States (Alcohol and Tobacco Tax and Trade
Bureau, 2016). That is a lot of AVAs for consumers to
consider in their purchasing decisions. A proposed means to
strengthen the recognition of these smaller AVAs is to follow
the model initiated by Napa Valley vignerons, and to tie a sub-
regional AVA name to the larger region through conjunctive
labels. Conjunctive labelling is specifiaclly defined as labelling
of a wine to show both region and sub-regions of origin
(Sonoma County Vintners, 2016). However conjunctive label-
ling is not common in the US, despite the success of Napa
Valley as a role model.
Conjunctive labeling has long been accepted in Europe, and

is one of the major methods in which wine regions, or smaller
groups of wineries within a larger region, can gain interna-
tional brand recognition. One of the oldest is Chateauneuf du
Pape, which requires wineries to use a special crest on bottles
of wine produced in the region. Rioja also implemented a very
successful conjunctive labeling campaign as far back as 1926
by requiring that approved wineries include a small seal on the
back label. Today that seal doubles as a security system –
guaranteeing the authenticity of the wine within the bottle
(Rioja Wine, 2014). The famous black rooster symbol on
bottles of wine from the Chianti Classico region (Bell, 2016),
and the prestigious eagle motif on bottles of wine classified as
VDP in Germany (VDP, 2016) are other examples of similar
systems.
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Conjunctive labelling is becoming a more common practice
in other wine producing countries, like Spain and New
Zealand. Spanish wine labelling is controlled by the European
law on the organization of the wine market. These regulations
are administered by the Office of the Deputy Director-General
of Quality Wines, which is an agency of the Ministry of
Agriculture. For wine destined to be classified as a ‘Wine of
Quality’, it must first be associated with a specific region of
production, which must be indicated on the label. Additionally,
if the grapes sourced for making the wine are from within a
specific, and recognized, plot of land or vineyard that is
acknowledged by the authorities, then the name of that plot or
vineyard may be used in addition to the indication of the
region of production. Such concepts are examples of con-
junctive labelling in effect outside of the United States
(European Union 2006).

Before conjunctive labeling was approved in Sonoma
County, many of the county's sub-AVAs conducted their
own marketing activities. For example the Sonoma Valley
Wineries Association actually started the Sonoma Wine
auction, which today is a fundraiser including all Sonoma
County wineries. The Russian River Valley Winegrowers
Association hosts a Paulee wine dinner each autumn, and the
wineries in Northern Sonoma County still work together to
produce the very popular Barrel Tasting Weekend, which
attracts thousands of tourists every March to taste wine and
buy futures. Today these types of marketing activities hosted
by the sub-AVAs continue, but Sonoma County Vintners and
the Sonoma County Winegrape Commission work very closely
to insure that there is a focused and united marketing strategy
for all Sonoma County wine regions. This includes conducting
both national and international tasting events, inviting somme-
liers each year to attend the Sonoma Summit, hosting a Barrel
Auction were retailers can purchase futures of Sonoma County
wines, sponsoring Taste of Sonoma for consumers to taste
local wines and foods, and now overseeing the Sonoma
County Wine Auction, with proceeds going to local charities
(SVC, 2016). In 2017, this auction achieved a record-breaking
$5.2 million (Melnik, 2017). These achievements are note-
worthy, but the question of whether they would be more
effective as events promoting a sub-region, or as part of a
larger AVA, is of most interest to producers within the region.

Consequently, the aim of this study is to determine if
Sonoma County can follow Napa Valley's success in establish-
ing salience for the region in the mind of the consumer through
the use of conjunctive labeling. We present an overview of
awareness of various wine areas leading to a comparison of the
awareness of Sonoma County and the smaller AVA's within
that region both before and after adopting a conjunctive
approach on their wine labels.

2. Review of the literature

2.1. Perceptions of a regional identity

Creating a place-based identity is often suggested as a
strategy for success in the wine sector. The difficulty is that its
proponents communicate mixed messages on what to do in
regards to implementing such a strategy. In numerous con-
sumer goods industries, the market leaders typically show the
direction on which competitors may follow (Helms, 1997). For
example, small producers in the soda market can follow Coca-
Cola and Pepsi, while food marketers can follow the examples
of large companies such as Unilever and General Mills.
However, the wine sector's largest companies frequently adopt
opposing strategies, making the cues for smaller producers
much harder to divine. As Gray (2016) explained, Constella-
tion is one of the largest wine companies in the world and
invests heavily in the acquisition of wine brands, while the
world's largest family-owned wine company, Gallo, invests
heavily in location through the acquisition of vineyards. The
former company's strategy depends primarily on creating brand
name awareness, while the latter expects regional salience for
the grapes used in wine production to help generate sales. Both
of these approaches can incorporate elements of regional
branding, but it is not the overall thrust of their marketing
strategies.
Nevertheless, there is a growing body of evidence in the

food and beverage industries showing a trend in the production
and communication of products tied to regional identities. The
practice is gaining more popularity for a variety of reasons,
including the need to present a unified image, the need to
protect a locality's identity in the face of national and
international competition, and the prospect of promoting the
larger regional identity to help gain consumer acceptance.
Contò et al. (2014) proposed the purpose of establishing a
regional identity is to inform, educate and promote specific
product or location characteristics. Christensen et al.
(forthcoming) expanded on these findings to establish a
framework for illustrating how a regional identity is recog-
nized as a means for creating economic benefits to wine
producers and wine regions. Clearly, the anticipated economic
benefits remain the driver behind the adoption of region or
place based marketing.
Recent research in Italy has shown that promoting the agro-

food sector has significant impacts on tourism (Santeramo
et al., 2017). There is a segment of tourists, defined as wine
tourists, who take the wine product to be a primary reason to
travel to a place. For other segments, the wine product serves
to make a particular destination more attractive. The synergis-
tic relationship between the wine industry and Italian tourism
was analyzed using an econometric model. Santeramo et. al
(2017) concluded that exploiting the synergies between the
wine sector and the tourism industry could foster the economic
development of the regional economy. Conjunctive labelling
for wine is one such synergistic tool that could provide
economic benefits to a region beyond just the wine sector.
Increased awareness of wine regions and AVAs can contribute
to tourism also.
The implication for those connected with the development

of a strategy to attract wine tourists and consumers is that if a
region's image is positive, then local producers benefit by
contributing to the development of this regional identity (Orth
et al., 2012). The bottom-line is that establishing a positive
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regional identity helps generate tourism and its subsequent
revenues, as Engelbrecht et al. (2014) illustrated in the case of
South Africa. Similarly, wine producers in smaller AVAs may
benefit from collaboration not only with those producers
located in their own AVA, but also with others located within
the larger region. Following this prescription should lead to the
generation of increased awareness for the positive character-
istics of the smaller AVAs.

2.2. Awareness precedes perception

Marketing practice in wine illustrates that consumers must
first be made aware of a region's existence before perception
can be effectively conveyed. One factor contributing to the
creation of awareness is the mere repetition effect (Cacic et
al., 2011; Luck, 2012). Advertising practice has relied on
consumers being exposed to an advertisement enough times
in order for the message to create awareness in viewers’
minds. This process has been generalised to the creation of
brand awareness (Barwise and Ehrenberg, 1987; Luck, 2012;
Romaniuk et al., 2003), and is replicated similarly for
creating regional awareness in wine production areas (Cacic
et al., 2011).

Researchers have found that a third of respondents indicated
that a place of origin is a consideration in wine purchasing
(Engelbrecht et al., 2014). Their findings illustrated that
regions that communicated a clear and consistently appealing
message helped influence purchasing behavior from amid an
ocean of geographically indistinct alternatives (Engelbrecht et
al., 2014). Thus, regional organizations can be led to believe
that a geographic identity must be repeatedly promoted in
order to gain traction in the consumer's mind. However, even
though the process of communicating an additional indicator
of regional identity as a means to create awareness is the
starting point of many communication strategies, the value as
an ongoing promotional tool is questioned by some wine
communicators. Further, emerging evidence suggests there are
diminishing returns as additional wine areas are created and
promoted beyond the number of those that already exist. There
are fears that the growing abundance in promoted wine regions
is becoming overwhelming to the wine consumer (Engelbrecht
et al., 2014). Recently, opinion pieces from leading wine
writers question the rationale behind an increase in the number
of designated wine areas, claiming that this abundance of
choice is an issue in need of redress (Gray, 2014; Heimoff,
2015).

2.3. Wine appellations as a regional identifier

Information about the place of origin of a product is often
employed by consumers to make inferences about the quality
of the product (Balestrini and Gamble, 2006; Showers and
Showers, 1993). Wine is a product that has a very close
connection to its place of origin and thus, it has been shown to
be a useful to consumers as a factor in decision making when
purchasing wine (Duhan et al.,1999). International research has
shown that the geographic origin of wine is the most important
attribute for consumers in both Australia and New Zealand
(Atkin et al., 2007a). Origin information has a halo effect that
helps consumers make inferences about unfamiliar wines.
Jarvis and Rungie (2002) found that the category “well known
region” had the highest stated choice utility among all
respondents in their study. Accordingly, the geographic
information can be a useful tool for conveying a wine's appeal
to consumers.

2.4. Relationship of geographic information to product quality

Consumers often refer to geographic information to make
inferences about the quality of the product (Verlegh and
Steenkamp, 1999). Regional reputation and quality can be
key drivers of consumer demand (Foti et al., 2011). Further-
more, wine quality programs associated with regions and
AVA's have been shown to help penetrate regional metropo-
litan markets (Rendleman et al., 2016).
Among the cues on a wine package that may influence the

consumer's evaluation are country of origin, region of origin
and sub-regional appellation (AVA). The wine's vintage, grape
variety, style, and vineyard may also appear on the label. The
geographic origin of the wine has been shown by recent
studies to be perceived as an indicator of quality and may be
used as the basis of a purchase decision (Duhan et al., 1999).
Taken has a whole, the previous research suggests that
consumers will use a wine's region of origin as a cue for
quality, and since their awareness of larger designations will
likely be greater than that of smaller AVAs, the larger regions
will be a greater factor in making quality evaluations.

2.5. Wine consumer attributes impacting the importance of
regional identification

Many consumer attributes have been identified which are
important to wine marketers and merit consideration for
inclusion in this study. Wine consumption frequency, and
consumer involvement were factors explored by Bruwer and
Johnson (2010) in an examination of the attributes that
contribute to interest in place-based marketing. A willingness
to learn about wine was positively related to the importance of
region in making wine purchasing decisions. With research on
learning consistently indicating that repetition and reinforce-
ment aid the process, the current study's research propositions
were based on the specific variables included in the analysis of
frequency of wine consumption and gender.

2.5.1. Frequency of wine consumption
Frequent wine drinkers are important to wine marketers

because they have a tendency to purchase wine in greater
volume, and their experience with wine may shape the opinion
of others (Thach and Olsen, 2015). It has been suggested that
high frequency wine drinkers were more likely to focus on
wines from a premium region (Goodman et al., 2006), there-
fore suggesting they must be paying attention to region of
origin. But it appears that light wine buyers, who purchase
wine less frequently, may also consider region of origin in
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their purchases. It appears that those who purchase less
frequently prefer wines from countries with which they are
most familiar (Chrysochou et al., 2011). In either case, region
of origin plays a role in the selection process. While previous
research is not conclusive, it is possible the greater frequency
of wine consumption leads to greater personal experience and
wine knowledge, which may impact the use of region of origin
information.
2.5.2. Gender
Gender is an important demographic variable in wine

research and was chosen for inclusion in this study. Atkin
et al. (2007b) investigated the impact of a consumer's gender
on buying decisions and responses to the wine purchasing
situation. They found that there was a clear difference in the
coping mechanisms of each gender when sufficient informa-
tion could not be obtained. The most popular method for both
men and women was to rely on region of origin. Women,
however, showed a stronger tendency to rely upon secondary
criteria such as medals won, price, and label artwork.

Atkin and Johnson (2010), in a later study, also found that
men rely on regional information to a greater extent than do
women. However, research findings have not always been so
conclusive. For example, this study found that gender was not
a significant predictor of preferring wine from a well-known
region versus a lesser-known region (Goodman 2006). How-
ever, in some markets gender may influence consumers’
preferences for wines for different well-known regions. For
example, Fulconis and Viviani (2006) report Romanian men
had a stronger preference for French wines and Romanian
women had a stronger preference for Italian wines. While
somewhat tentative at this point, it appears that men may use
regional information more, or at least differently, than women
do.
3. Research propositions

This research analyzes differences between two studies'
findings over a distinct period of time. The first was a study
conducted in 2008 regarding US consumer awareness of
Sonoma County as a region, as well as the smaller AVA
within its borders at that time. This study was completed
before conjunctive labeling was introduced to Sonoma County.
Therefore, a second research study was launched in 2016 to
determine if US wine consumers showed a any difference in
awareness of wine region AVAs, two years after the con-
junctive labeling law went into effect.

As such, the results of the two studies were compared as a
means to evaluate a series of research propositions on the
impact of conjunctive labeling on wine region awareness in the
minds of wine consumers. These hypotheses are as follows:

H1. Consumers will use a wine's country, state, and specific
appellation or AVA as an important cue when judging the
quality of the wine.
H2. A larger regional designation, such as state or county, will
be more heavily utilized in consumers’ evaluation of wine
quality versus smaller appellations and AVAs.

H3. The different levels of awareness of regions and appella-
tions will vary by consumer attributes between 2008 and 2016.
The specific attributes are:

H3.1. High frequency wine drinkers will exhibit greater
awareness of AVAs than lower frequency wine drinkers.

H3.2. Based on the literature review, it is predicted that
gender will affect awareness of AVAs.

4. Methodology

A survey methodology was used to gather data to address the
research hypotheses. The first survey was developed in 2008, and
was administered as an online survey to a convenience sample of
409 US adult wine drinkers, utilizing the services of Survey
Sampling International. Results were initially published in 2010
(Atkin and Johnson, 2010) and subsequently elsewhere (Atkin
and Newton, 2012; Atkin and Thach, 2012). The second survey
administered in 2016, included the same original questions as
well as the addition of one item regarding sustainability in the list
of attributes used to judge wine quality. This attribute was added
because the topic of sustainably-made wines has become more
important in the past several years in the US, and is also a
differentiation factor being used to communicate Sonoma County
wine brands.
The 2016 survey was administered in the same online

fashion as the 2008 survey by Survey Sampling International,
and resulted in data from 403 US adult wine drinkers. In both
cases, respondents were a self-select sample from the compa-
ny's panel participants, and although they were a geographi-
cally diverse group of US wine drinkers, neither sample is a
random sample of the general population. Furthermore, both
samples were not composed of the same respondents. How-
ever, in analyzing sample demographics, there were many
similarities between both data sets and the makeup of the two
samples are discussed below, and in Table 1.

4.1. Survey development

In order to measure the attributes used by consumers to
evaluate quality of wine, the standard rating scale of decision-
making cues adopted by Goodman et al. (2008) was used. This
included items such as brand, vintage, country, region,
appellation, etc. Respondents were instructed to check all that
criteria that applied to their evaluation process. Survey
respondents were then asked to “please name up to 5 wine
regions (specific regions, not whole countries) in the United
States or around the world”. The purpose of this open-ended
question was to determine how familiar they were with
different wine regions when using unaided recall and they
were not allowed to return to that section after completing it.
Awareness of a range of wine places of origin was measured

by asking respondents to rate their awareness from a list of
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geographic areas including well known regions (Bordeaux,
Napa Valley, Sonoma County) and several smaller appella-
tions within Sonoma County. Respondents indicated their
choices on a 5-point Likert scale using poor (1) to great
(5) as the endpoints.

In order to measure consumer attributes, a variety of
standard wine scales were used. For consumption frequency,
we used the original Wine Market Council (2008) definition
stating that those who drink wine at least once per week are
considered to be core wine consumers, and those who indicated
they drink less often than at least once per week were
considered to be marginal wine consumer. All respondents
were initially screened to ensure they purchased a bottle of wine
at least once in the past year. These questions all help define a
respondent's involvement with wine, which helps explain
different levels of consumer product knowledge, according to
Zaichkowsky (1985). Finally, standard demographic questions
Table 1
Survey description comparisons between 2008 and 2016 studies.

2008 Survey 2016 Survey

Total Respondents
409 403

Gender
Male 47% 45%
Female 53% 55%

Age Group
21-29 14.4% 17.0%
30-39 18.8% 26.3%
40-49 26.0% 16.2%
50-59 16.6% 18.5%
60 and over 24.3% 22.0%

Respondent Provenance 2008 Survey 2016 Survey
Total States Listed 46 46
California 16.5% 11.2%
New York 8.8% 10.2%
Illinois 4.0% 8.2%
Florida 9.8% 6.7%
Texas 5.0% 6.2%
Pennsylvania 6.3% 4.5%
New Jersey 3.8% 4.2%

Fig. 1. Reported quality indicators
regarding gender, age, education level, marital status, and state
of residency were included in the survey.

4.2. Sample demographics for 2008 and 2016 surveys

There were many similarities between the two samples, as
illustrated in Table 1. For example, the gender split was quite
close with 47% male in 2008 as opposed to 45% male in 2016,
and 53% female in 2008 vs 55% female in 2016. The ages of
respondents tended to be similar, though more young people
responded to the 2016 survey than compared to the 2008
survey. This may be because more members of the younger
Millennial generation were of legal drinking age in 2016, and
they are reported to be the largest US wine drinking generation
(Wine Market Council, 2016).
In terms of state origin, respondents from both the 2008 and

2016 samples came from 46 states. Six of the seven states with
the most responses were the same as in 2008, with California,
New York, Illinois, Florida, Texas, Pennsylvania and New
Jersey having the highest percentages. This matches with US
wine sales data showing these states as being in the top 10 for
wine sales (Beverage Information Group, 2014). The remain-
ing 39 states each contributed less than 4% each to the sample.

5. Results

5.1. Do consumers utilize geographic indicators in their
selection process?

To address H1 concerning consumers’ use of a wine's
geographic origin when evaluating quality, a series of ques-
tions were analyzed. The first of these questions asked
respondents to check their usage of wine decision-making
cues when determining the quality of the wine inside the
bottle. Fig. 1 shows a comparison of the information sources
that each group preferred.
A higher, 76.7% of the 2008 survey respondents indicated

that they utilized brand more often than other possible
attributes when evaluating wine quality by the label. In the
2016 sample, that proportion of respondents was lower
(69.7%). In both surveys, the country of origin and then
region of origin follow in order of popularity with respondents.
when evaluating wine choices.



T. Atkin et al. / Wine Economics and Policy 6 (2017) 155–164 161
This evidence supports H1, being the proposition that con-
sumers will use a wine's country, state, and specific appellation
or AVA as an important cue when judging the quality of wine.
5.2. Do Wine consumers focus on state, county or region in
their evaluations?

While the utilization of brand evaluation was somewhat
lower in the 2016 sample, the country of origin criterion is of
greater importance, while the region criterion is similar
between the samples. The percentage of respondents using
appellation or AVA was lower, at 13.7% in 2016, when
compared to 19.7% of respondents in 2008. The criterion of
alcohol content was the only criterion to be higher in the 2016
sample when compared to the results of the 2008 sample.

This result provides support to the idea that US consumers
are not absorbing the detailed information conveyed by an
increasing number of smaller appellations. Consumers in 2016
continue to rely more upon larger geographical and political
entities such as region, country and state, than smaller
appellations. The lower usage of appellation information may
indicate that US consumers may suffer from information
overload concerning the quantity and complexity of smaller
appellations, such as those outlined in specific AVA's. These
findings lend support for H2.
5.3. Consumer awareness of wine regions

The reduction in the use of smaller appellations or AVAs as
a cue for quality is also borne out in the consumers’ ability to
name wine regions without prompting. This was an open-
ended question where respondents were asked to name up to
five wine regions worldwide with no hints or reference about
country, state, region, or appellation. Table 2 illustrates the
results of this analysis.

Napa again received the most mentions in 2016, with 207,
followed by California with 107 mentions. Sonoma County
was third with 79 mentions. It is interesting to note that the
larger political regions were more familiar to the 2016 sample
(i.e. California, France, Italy), while the smaller entities such as
Napa, Sonoma, Bordeaux, and Champagne received fewer
mentions in 2016 than in 2008. Respondents in 2016 do not
Table 2
Respondent awareness of major wine regions.

Indicated Region 2008 Survey Frequency
Mentioned

2016 Survey Frequency
Mentioned

Don't Know 743 690
Napa 259 207
Sonoma 96 79
California 79 107
Bordeaux 52 51
Champagne 44 35
France 26 56
Italy 25 54
illustrate the same level of awareness of wine regions within
countries as was observed in 2008.
In order to get a more accurate quantitative picture of the

results, respondents were asked to rate their awareness of the
wine from several regions and general appellations on a
5-point Likert scale from 1 (poor) to 5 (great). Tellingly, the
mean awareness of Sonoma County was higher in the 2016
sample (3.21) than the 2008 sample (2.86). Consistently with
established theory that larger regions have greater awareness
than smaller regions, Sonoma County was better known by
wine consumers than any of the sub-regions contained within
the County's boundaries. This consistent order of considera-
tions affirms that H2 is supported.
Interestingly, even though the larger County benefited from

a higher level of awareness in the 2016 sample, each of
Sonoma County's sub-regions showed an even greater increase
in awareness in the latter study. The mean awareness for each
of the sub-regions was greater in 2016, with increases ranging
from .53 to .88. The increase in the mean for Sonoma County
was only .35. Table 3 illustrates these findings.

5.4. Do varying consumer attributes impact wine region
awareness levels?

In order to test H3, hypotheses propose that the difference in
awareness between 2008 and 2016 for regions and appellations
will vary based upon the specific consumer attributes of H3.1:
frequency of wine consumption; and H3.2: gender. The
findings are discussed below.

5.5. Impact of wine consumption frequency on regional
awareness

This information was used to see if the difference in regional
awareness varies by frequency of wine consumption. For each
of the regions and AVAs, a one-way analysis of variance was
performed using the consumption habits of wine consumers to
split the respondents into two groups, core and marginal. The
results show that the 2016 sample consumed wine more
frequently (73%) than the 2008 sample (65.7%). Subsequent
to the means comparison analysis, the difference in mean
awareness ranking was conducted for the AVAs subjected to
conjunctive labelling regulations. Independent, two-sample
tests revealed statistical differences by consumption frequency
Table 3
Respondent awareness of wine sub-regions from 2008 and 2016.

Region/AVA Mean Mean Awareness
2008 2016 Difference

Sonoma County (to) 2.86 3.21 .35
Russian River Valley 1.47 2.03 .56
Dry Creek Valley 1.32 2.06 .74
Carneros 1.16 1.69 .53
Green Valley 1.09 1.97 .88

Differences significant at p o .000.



Table 5
Gender differences in wine sub-region knowledge between 2008 and 2016
studies.

Male
2008

Male
2016

Difference Female
2008

Female
2016

Difference

Sonoma
County

3.17 3.35 0.18 2.56 3.14 0.58

Russian
River
Valley

1.79 2.28 0.49 1.18 1.85 0.67

Dry Creek
Valley

1.62 2.24 0.62 1.02 1.93 0.91

Carneros 1.47 1.95 0.48* 0.89 1.50 0.61
Green
Valley

1.35 2.10 0.75 0.89 1.86 0.97

All differences in bold are significant for the Mann–Whitney test of difference
with 99% confidence.

*Mann–Whitney significance test of difference in means with 95%
confidence (Z ¼ -2.244, sig 0.025)

Table 4
Difference in wine sub-regional (awareness) knowledge for high and low
involved wine consumers in 2016 study when compared to 2008 study.

Core
2008

Core
2016

Difference Marginal
2008

Marginal
2016

Difference

Sonoma
County

3.12 3.43 0.31 2.37 2.62 0.25

Russian
River Valley

1.78 2.24 0.46 0.90 1.42 0.52

Dry Creek
Valley

1.54 2.30 0.76 0.88 1.41 0.53*

Carneros 1.41 1.92 0.51 0.71 1.05 0.34**

Green
Valley

1.29 2.17 0.88 0.72 1.40 0.68

All differences in bold are significant for the Mann–Whitney test of difference
with 99% confidence.

*Mann–Whitney significance test of difference in means with 95%
confidence (Z ¼ -2.083, sig 0.037).

**Mann–Whitney significance test of difference in means with 90%
confidence (Z ¼ -1.861, sig 0.063).
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in the distribution of responses between the 2008 and 2016
samples, as shown in Table 4, below.

The notable finding is that weekly or more frequently
consuming respondents (Core consumers) not only indicate a
greater level of awareness of each AVA, but the 2016
respondents returned a significantly higher mean value of
awareness for AVAs subjected to conjunctive labelling regula-
tions than respondents categorized in the non-core category of
wine consumers. The greater frequency with which core wine
consumers drink wine would be an explanation consistent with
the well-established literature on exposure frequency leading to
greater retention of new concepts (Krugman 1977, Bornstein
and Craver-Lemley 2016).

Smaller AVAs performed better in the awareness metric in
2016 compared to 2008, specifically among core wine
consumers. Awareness of Sonoma County was greater among
non-core consumers in the 2016 sample, with a mean of 2.62,
compared with a mean of 2.37 in 2008. The difference among
core consumers was greater with the 2016 sample having a
mean value of .31 more than the 2008 sample. This is
important to wine marketers because core consumers represent
a greater share of wine sales. The increases were generally
greater among the core consumers as opposed to marginal
consumers, with Russian River Valley being an exception.
These findings lend support to H3.1.

5.6. Impact of gender on wine regional awareness

Independent, two-sample tests revealed statistical differ-
ences by gender in the distribution of responses between the
2008 and 2016 samples, as shown in Table 5, below. The
AVA awareness rankings illustrate the difference in mean
values between responses from the 2008 and 2016 samples,
grouped by respondent gender. The notable finding is that
female respondents returned a significantly higher mean value
of awareness for all AVAs subjected to conjunctive labelling
regulations, when compared to the difference in results
between samples for males.
Even though men indicated a greater mean awareness of

these AVAs in both studies, females illustrated a substantial
narrowing of the difference by indicating a greater awareness
of AVAs in 2016, when compared with the 2008 findings.
Again, conjunctive labeling could well be attributed as the
reason for to the higher awareness of these AVAs in the
important segment of the market comprised of women.
The results of these analyses support H3.2. The difference in

the level of awareness between 2008 and 2016 on regions and
appellations did vary based upon the consumer attributes of
wine consumption frequency and gender.

6. Discussion

This study has several implications, from both an academic
and managerial perspective.

6.1. Academic perspective

In terms of adding to the body of academic knowledge, the
results support previous research illustrating that regional wine
branding is important and helps to increase consumer aware-
ness of a region (Tustin and Lockshin, 2001; Papadopoulos
and Heslop, 2002; Hall, 2003; Lee and Arcodia, 2011;
Christensen et al., forthcoming). Furthermore, the use of
conjunctive labeling in Sonoma County illustrates that more
consumers in the 2016 sample reported an awareness of
individual AVAs when compared to the 2008 sample. This
suggests that conjunctive labeling is a useful branding tool,
with consumers remembering sub regions to a greater degree
when established within larger regions.
Likewise, this study supports previous research illustrating

that certain consumer attributes are more apt to respond to
campaigns creating awareness of regional identifiers (Bruwer
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and Johnson, 2010). For example, consumers who consumed
more wine reported higher awareness levels of Sonoma
County as a region and several of its AVAs. Furthermore,
gender played a role in that more men in the study reported a
higher level of knowledge of the Sonoma County region and
AVAs than women. However, it is possible this may also be
due to the fact that men have been shown to prefer to flaunt
their knowledge about wine as a way to show off, whereas
women prefer to use wine as a social lubricant (Thach, 2012).
It should be noted however that women are showing greater
awareness of AVAs in 2016 than they did in 2008. This may
be because the Sonoma County conjunctive label is now
appearing in grocery stores and retail shops, and more
women shop and purchase wine than men in these locations
(Thach, 2012).

6.2. Management implications

When comparing the 2008 and 2016 studies, it is important to
recognize the fact that there was greater geographic awareness at
all levels – both regionally and at the AVA level - suggesting
that conjunctive labeling has had an impact. Given this
conclusion, most regional wine marketing managers and asso-
ciations should consider the benefits of a collaborative regional
marketing program, as well as agreement on branding, brand
story, and logo. Though this can often be a challenging process
in the wine industry, where individual producers may have
differing viewpoints on branding, the payoff from working
together to promote a regional wine brand appears to be worth
it. This also supports the findings of Taplin (2011) illustrating
that a cohesive regional effort can result in growth and success.

The fact that other regions in California are considering
adopting conjunctive labeling, such as San Luis Obispo
(Caputo, 2016), is further testament in support of this regional
wine branding tool. Overall, these results show that it is
possible to combat the diminished awareness of small appella-
tions by linking them to the larger regional appellation, which
may be more familiar to consumers.

7. Limitations, future research and conclusion

There are several limitations with this study, resulting in
opportunities for future research. An obvious one is the fact
that two different samples of consumers were used for data
collection, and therefore the findings may be influenced by
different sample attributes. Furthermore, the samples were
obtained through panel participants and the method of obtain-
ing respondents could have introduced sample bias as well.
Despite these two issues, the fact that both samples very
similar in demographics, provided a wide geographic repre-
sentation of 46 US states, and were large in size – both being
over 400 respondents – attempts to offset some of these
concerns. However, in the future, it would be useful to obtain a
representative sample providing a true longitudinal study with
the same respondents over time.

Other limitations, which are often found in time-elapsed
studies, include differences in the environment, economy, value
systems, pricing, politics, and other factors that may impact
brand perceptions and purchase decisions. Also the fact that the
first study was conducted in 2008, in the midst of a global
recession, and the second study in 2016, when the economic
situation had improved in the US, could have impacted results.
In conclusion, this study set out to analyze whether regional

branding and conjunctive wine labeling would help to improve
wine regional awareness in the mind of consumers. The results
show that there was a greater level of prompted awareness at
the regional level, and even more so for the smaller appella-
tions of the county. Therefore, conjunctive labeling offers
potential value as a marketing tool for use in other small
regions, where positive connections can be made in the
consumer's mind to a larger region from which it is associated.
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