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Research Campus Mobility2Grid 

The “Research Campus Mobility2Grid – Renewable Energy and Electromobility for Smart 
Urban Environments” was launched in 2013 and is part of the funding initiative “Research 
Campus – public-private-partnerships for innovations” of the Federal Ministry of Education 
and Research (BMBF) in Germany. The funding initiative is aimed at “supporting large-scale 
and long-term approaches to single-site cooperation between science and industry”1. The 
main objective of the Research Campus Mobility2Grid is to realize and bring together the 
energy and mobility transition. 36 partners from various different sectors collaborate in seven 
different thematic areas (like “smart grid infrastructure”, “connected e-mobility”, or “digital 
spaces”) to assess and implement innovative solutions to ensure an affordable and secure 
supply of electricity, heat and transport fully based on renewable energies. The partner 
network comprises large technology companies like Siemens and Schneider Electric, Berlin’s 
public transport company BVG and Berlin’s municipal waste disposal company BSR, start-
ups like the roller-sharing service emmy, the Technical University Berlin, research 
organizations like the WZB Berlin Social Science Center and the FZI Research Center for 
																																																													
1	BMBF	2017:	Research	Campus	Funding	Initiative.	
https://www.bmbf.de/pub/Research_Campus_Funding_Initiative.pdf	



Information Technology and the cooperative BürgerEnergieBerlin that aims at buying Berlin’s 
electricity grid. The consortium founded a non-profit association to coordinate the overall 
project and a collection society for the exploitation of joint ideas and products. The project is 
divided into a preliminary phase lasting from March 2013 until March 2015 and a main phase 
that started in January 2016 and is expected to last until 2020. The site of cooperation is the 
EUREF-Campus in Berlin, Germany. A self-proclaimed “urban living lab for the 
Energiewende,” EUREF aims to be a research and demonstration site for future smart and 
sustainable city arrangements.   

For a complete list of partner organizations as well as projects and events carried out by the 
Research Campus Mobility2Grid please have a look at the website: 
http://www.mobility2grid.de 

 

Energieavantgarde Anhalt 

The regional renewable energy network, the “Energieavantgarde Anhalt”  (EAA), has been 
officially launched in 2014, when a heterogeneous group of actors gave birth to the idea of 
becoming a pioneer region for energy transitions. At the heart of the EAA vision are the local 
production and consumption of energy and the integration of electricity, heat and mobility. 
Since the beginning, hopes are pinned on presenting the region as a testing ground for 
energy related business ideas and products, for research activities, as well as for socio-
economic changes and a stronger participation of citizens within the region. The region is 
part of the federal state of Saxony-Anhalt and counts 380,000 inhabitants. Already today, its 
share of electricity derived from renewables amounts up to 50 per cent 
(www.energieavantgarde.de). Recognizing a lack of tangible political action at the federal 
level in future energy policies, the initiative’s vision attracted nation-wide interests from 
foundations and research organizations, who joined the network, pushing towards next steps 
and helping to raise funding. Today, a larger group of organizations engages in this collective 
undertaking, from both the local and supra-regional level: Germany’s main environmental 
protection agency Umweltbundesamt with its headquarter located in Dessau, regional grid 
provider enviaM, companies in the field of energy services like Tilia GmbH and Tesvolt 
GmbH, the local municipalities like Wittenberg and Dessau-Roßlau, the public utility 
companies of Dessau, Köthen, and Bitterfeld-Wolfen. Further, a number of research 
organizations is part of the network, like the Reiner-Lemoine-Institute, the WZB Berlin Social 
Science Center and the Anhalt University of Applied Sciences; and non-profit foundations as 
the innogy foundation for energy and society, the Halekala foundation, and the 100 percent 
renewable foundation. EAA chose to found a non-profit association as its organizational form 
to encourage participation of citizens and companies alike. EAA activities are mainly funded 
by two non-profit organizations.  

For a complete list of partner organizations as well as projects and events carried out by the 
EAA please have a look at the website https://www.energieavantgarde.de/. 

 


